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Multiple Choice  
1. My friend prepares for tests 
by reviewing everything she 
learned. She __________ studies 
for her exams. 
(a) sometimes 
(b) always 
(c) rarely 
(d) usually 
 
2. John feels dizzy when he sees 
blood. He __________ looks at 
medical videos. 
(a) always 
(b) usually 
(c) never 
(d) often 
 
3. The computer system often 
has small problems. It 
__________ crashes suddenly. 
(a) always 
(b) never 
(c) occasionally 
(d) rarely 
 
4. She eats healthy meals and 
exercises daily. She __________ 
gets a cold. 
(a) rarely 
(b) always 
(c) often 
(d) usually 
 
5. My little sister likes to sing 
loudly at home. She __________ 
sings when she's happy. 
(a) never 

(b) seldom 
(c) hardly ever 
(d) often 
 
6. The old train station is very 
quiet now. A train __________ 
stops there. 
(a) seldom 
(b) always 
(c) often 
(d) usually 
 
7. He is very good at cooking 
new things. He __________ tries 
different recipes. 
(a) never 
(b) frequently 
(c) rarely 
(d) seldom 
 
8. Our city has a lot of rain in 
spring. It __________ rains 
heavily in April. 
(a) usually 
(b) rarely 
(c) never 
(d) sometimes 
 
9. I like to read books before 
bed. I __________ read for about 
30 minutes. 
(a) never 
(b) seldom 
(c) always 
(d) generally 
 

10. My neighbor only travels 
during the summer. He 
__________ travels in winter. 
(a) always 
(b) never 
(c) usually 
(d) often 
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Fill in the Gaps 
1. He lives next door. I 
__________ 
(seldom/frequently/always) see 
him. 
 
2. She is an excellent chef. Her 
food __________ 
(never/sometimes/always) 
tastes delicious. 
 
3. I'm trying to save money. I 
__________ 
(often/always/rarely) buy 
expensive things. 
 
4. The internet connection is 
terrible. It __________ 
(always/frequently/never) 
works perfectly. 
 
5. My grandfather is 90 years 
old. He __________ 
(always/frequently/rarely) goes 
jogging. 
 
6. Students need to attend 
classes. They __________ 
(sometimes/always/frequently) 
skip important lectures. 
 
7. He's very forgetful. He 
__________ 
(rarely/often/always) forgets his 
keys. 
 
8. It's a desert climate. It 
__________ 
(sometimes/frequently/never) 
rains a lot. 
 
9. I like to keep fit. I __________ 
(never/seldom/always) exercise 
in the morning. 
 
10. Bees make honey. They 
__________ 
(always/frequently/never) 
pollinate flowers. 
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